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OFFERING SUMMARY

Lease Rate: $1.95 SF/month (Full Service,
less janitorial)

Available SF: 10,966 +/- RSF

Lot Size: 1.34 Acres

Building Size: 19,919 SF

DEMOGRAPHICS 1 MILE 5 MILES 10 MILES

Total Households 3,307 83,951 126,811

Total Population 11,001 228,544 341,685

Average HH Income $39,556 $52,436 $58,973

PROPERTY DESCRIPTION

Entire second-floor office space is available in this two-story
stunning professional office building. This property is in a fantastic
location not far from Interstate 5, with convenient access to
Salem's Central Business District. The building features high-
quality finishes, ADA accessibility and is impeccably maintained
and locally owned and managed. The space is currently occupied
till January 31, 2022. Occupancy prior to January 31 is
negotiable.

PROPERTY HIGHLIGHTS
Efficient layout and mix of offices

Private Elevator 

4 Conference Rooms

28 Private Offices

Ample Parking

Private Restrooms

Zone-IP

ADT 23,120 +/-

L
E

A
S

E

5-STAR PROFESSIONAL OFFICE BUILDING
3220 State Street SE, Suite 200, Salem, OR 97301



CBCRE.COM

Shadya Jones
503 884 6281
shadya@shadyajones.com MOUNTAIN WEST

REAL ESTATE

PROPERTY DESCRIPTION

Entire second-floor office space with a private elevator is available
in this two-story stunning professional office building. This
property is in a fantastic location not far from Interstate 5, with
convenient access to Salem's Central Business District. The
building features high-quality finishes, ADA accessibility and is
impeccably maintained and locally owned and managed. The
space is currently occupied till January 31, 2022. Occupancy prior
to January 31 is negotiable.

LOCATION DESCRIPTION

The ever-growing, dynamic, flourishing city of Salem is situated in
Oregon's Willamette River Valley, one of the Nation's most fertile
agricultural regions. This beautiful city is Oregon's second-largest
and is located about 46 miles southwest of Portland and about 58
miles East of the Oregon coast. Salem, the capital of Oregon,
serves as the core of both state agencies and the surrounding
farming communities. This metro area is home to the historic
downtown area, as well as the vineyard-wrapped Willamette
Valley countryside. It lies at the junction of Oregon State
Highways 22, 213, and 221. Interstate 5 provides transportation to
the North towards Portland and transportation to the South
towards Eugene.
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